
URPRO ADAPTER PANELS

The TZ Medical URPro is a universal system 
that directly replaces your current MAVIG™ 
shields with high-quality, long-lasting radiation 
protection panels. The new URPro Adapter 
panels are uniquely designed to fit over any 
MAVIG™ frame system* using an adjustable 
strap that quickly secures around the frame, 
making placement or removal quick and 
simple.  More importantly, each panel is 
well-structured, with fabric binding around the 
edges to reduce common issues with fraying 
and deterioration caused by long-term usage. 

*TZ Medical only supplies URPro Radiation
Protection Shields/Panels. All other components are
manufactured and trademarked products of the
MAVIG™ corporation.

Features
Attenuates 98% of secondary and scatter 
radiation at 80 kVp

Lead equivalent of 0.50 mm

Flexible straps that help secure the panels to 
current MAVIG™ bedside drape framing 
systems

Can replace any number of damaged panels

Fabric binding and structured frame reduces 
long-term fraying and deterioration
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FIND OUT MORE
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Item Number Description UOM

BDR-1015
BDR-1015-5

URPro Adapter Single Panel
URPro Adapter Panel Set

1 Each
Set of 5


